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ATTORNEYS FOR INTERVENORS

LATINO ISSUES FORUM
REQUEST FOR INTERVENOR COMPENSATION FOR SUBSTANTIAL CONTRIBUTION TO DECISION 05-10-044 BY LATINO ISSUES FORUM

Pursuant to California Public Utilities Code § 1801 et seq.  and Rule 76.71 et seq. of the Commission’s Rules of Practice and Procedure, Latino Issues Forum (“LIF”) requests that the California Public Utility Commission (“the Commission”) award it compensation in the amount of $23,444.62 for its substantial contributions to Decision 05-10-044.

The Commission instituted these proceedings in order to expediently address anticipated rising energy prices and their effect on customers in the winter.  LIF’s contributions ensured that low-income customers were protected against the most severe effects of the rising energy prices.

I.
ARGUMENT: LIF IS ENTITLED TO AN AWARD OF FEES.


LIF meets the requirements of California Public Utilities Code (CPUC) § 1803 to receive reasonable attorneys’ fees.  As will be demonstrated in the sections below, LIF has made a substantial contribution to the adoption of the Commission’s decision in Decision 05-10-044.  LIF’s participation in the proceedings without an award of fees would impose a significant financial hardship on LIF (see CPUC § 1803(b)).

A.
Significant Financial Hardship.


LIF meets the requirements of CPUC §§ 1803(b) and 1802(g) regarding significant financial hardship.  On July 12, 2002, in Decision 02-07-030, the Commission found that LIF had met the requirements of the financial hardship test.  Therefore, there is a rebuttable presumption that LIF is eligible under the significant hardship test.  LIF has historically and recently been found to meet the significant hardship test in recent fee awards. (See D.02-09-033; D.02-07-030; D.01-11-011; D.01-09-045).  In an abundance of caution, LIF again demonstrates below that it meets the financial hardship test.


LIF meets the definition of “significant financial hardship” contained in the California Public Utilities Code.  LIF is a Category 3 customer: a group or customer organized by its by-laws to represent customers.  For a Category 3 customer, “significant financial hardship” means that “the economic interest of the individual members of the group or organization is small in comparison to the costs of effective participation in the proceeding.” (CPUC § 1802(g)).  LIF represents the interests of low-income customers, language minority customers, and other vulnerable communities.  While the consumer protections that we championed are significant to individual customers, the savings we are able to provide are small compared to the costs of our participation.


The costs of our participating in proceedings for individual low income and moderate income customers are prohibitive and in great excess of the individual benefit derived.  LIF’s participation was essential to represent the interests of low income and moderate income customers who are faced with potential hardships due to the anticipated rising energy rates.  In addition, LIF focused on outreach to language minority communities who will not be reached by traditional English language methods.  LIF therefore meets the “economic interest” test of significant financial hardship.

1.
Timely Notice of Intent to Seek Compensation.


LIF filed a timely Notice of Intent (NOI) to Claim Compensation in this proceeding on February 13, 2004.  On April 5, 2004, Administrative Law Judge Sarah R. Thomas issued a ruling finding that LIF was a customer and ordering LIF to address the significant financial hardship test (which LIF had deferred in the NOI) in the request for compensation.  Significant financial hardship was addressed above in Section I.A.

////

B.
LIF’s Contribution’s Have Been Substantial.


As detailed below, LIF’s advocacy in this proceeding substantially contributed to many of the changes adopted in D.05-10-044.

1.
LIF recommended that Community Based Organizations be used to outreach 

regarding resources available to low-income customers.

LIF continued its long-standing recommendation that Community Based Organizations (CBOs) be used to outreach to low-income, language minority, and other vulnerable customers. See Comments of Latino Issues Forum on En Banc Hearing and Proposal Regarding Reducing Bill Impacts on Low Income Households due to High Natural Gas Prices this Winter, filed October 11, 2005 (“LIF Comments on Hearing”), p. 2; Opening Comments of Latino Issues Forum on Proposals for Reducing Bill Impacts on Low-Income Households due to High Natural Gas Prices this Winter, filed October 17, 2005 (“LIF Opening Comments”), pp. 2-3, 6.  LIF reasoned that CBOs would be best able to reach the vulnerable customers and provide information to them.  The Commission repeated this rationale in ordering Low Income Customer Energy Education Workshops to be conducted by CBOs. See D.05-10-044, pp. 23-25.

2.
LIF’s recommended that the CARE program’s eligibility be adjusted to 200% of the Federal Poverty Level.

LIF advocated that the California Alternate Rates for Energy (CARE) program eligibility limits be increased to 200% of the Federal Poverty Level. See LIF Opening Comments, pp. 4-5.  LIF reasoned that eligibility standards for low-income programs should be correlated, so as to facilitate administration of the programs and to lead to a universal automatic enrollment program. See id, p. 4.  LIF has continually presented this rationale, for example, most recently arguing that the Universal Lifeline Telephone Service program and CARE program eligibility standards should be correlated in CPUC Rulemaking 04-12-001.  The Commission adopted the recommendation to increase the CARE program eligibility standard. See D.05-10-044, p. 14.
3.
LIF recommended that LIEE programs be streamlined and leveraged, and that self-certified LIEE customers not be charged for mistaken enrollment.

LIF has long argued that the reason for calibrating the eligibility standards of various low-income programs is to facilitate cooperation and leveraging between the programs.  Therefore, in these proceedings, LIF supported allowing current CARE customers to participate in the Low Income Energy Efficiency (LIEE) program without requiring further income documentation. See LIF Opening Comments, p. 5.  However, LIF qualified its support, provided that there was also a policy to hold customers harmless for innocent mistakes. See id.  The Commission adopted both policies, noting that allowing self-certification of CARE customers into the LIEE program allowed for streamlined, efficient functioning. See D.05-10-044, pp. 14-16.  LIF also supported the proposal to allow for gas furnace and water heater replacement by the LIEE program (see LIF Opening Comments, p. 6), and these measures were adopted by the Commission. See D.05-10-044, pp. 19-22.

4.
LIF supported the proposal to suspend CARE recertification during the 


winter.


LIF supported the proposal to suspend CARE recertification during the winter, arguing that it was inappropriate during this coming winter to deny needed benefits from low-income customers based on the failure to fulfill administrative requirements. See LIF Opening Comments, p. 4.  The Commission adopted the recertification suspension. Se See D.05-10-044, pp. 11-12.
////

////


5.
LIF supported the moratorium on shutoffs for customers making partial 


payments.


LIF supported the proposal to institute a moratorium on service shutoffs for customers making at least partial payments. See Comments of The Utility Reform Network, Utility Consumers’ Action Network, Greenlining Institute, Latino Issues Forum, and Disability Rights Advocates Presenting Proposals for Reducing Bill Impacts Associated with High Natural Gas Prices this Winter, filed September 28, 2005 (“Joint Proposals”), p. 3, LIF Comments on Hearing, pp. 3-4.  The Commission adopted the moratorium on shutoffs for those customers making at least 50% payment of their bills. See D.05-10-044, p. 27.
C.
LIF Did Not Duplicate Efforts and Provided a Unique Perspective that Was Especially Necessary to Protect Vulnerable Communities’ Interests.

LIF provided a substantial contribution to Decision 05-10-044.  In a proceeding such as this one, where a number of parties commented on the same directions from the Commission, there is bound to be some overlap in comments.  LIF coordinated its efforts with other consumer groups.  However, LIF provided a unique perspective in this proceeding.  LIF was one of the only parties concerned with how outreach could be conducted to non-English speaking customers, and championed the role of CBOs to address this issue.  LIF provided a substantial contribution to this proceeding, and its compensation should not be reduced due to any perceived duplication.

////

////

D.
LIF’s Participation Was Necessary to Achieve the Correct Outcome; the Benefits Derived from LIF’s Participation Warrant Its Cost.

One of the requirements for receiving intervenor compensation is that an intervenor’s advocacy is necessary for a fair determination of the proceedings.  In Decision 98-04-059 the Commission further defined this standard as requiring the party weigh the costs of its participation against the benefits of the participation.  Decision 98-04-059 also requires a party’s participation to be guided by the Scoping Memos.  All of LIF’s participation was within the scope of the proceeding.  LIF’s unique participation provided the protection, facilitation, and augmentation of needed benefits to low-income and other vulnerable customers.  The benefits of LIF’s participation warrant its costs.

E.
LIF’s Participation Was Efficient and Its Intervenor Compensation Claims Are Reasonable.

In this filing, LIF is requesting intervenor compensation in the amount of $23,444.62, the time reasonably devoted to this proceeding, as well as for the expenses LIF reasonably incurred.  Following is a summary table of hours claimed, hourly rates, and direct expenses. The Intervenor Compensation Claim Summary is included in Appendix A.   A more detailed breakdown of hours is provided in Appendices B (for Susan Brown) and C (for Enrique Gallardo).  A more detailed breakdown of expenses is provided in Appendix D. 


Please note that only one half of all hours incurred in travel or in seeking compensation are claimed, so that no additional modification is necessary.

////

////

1.
Itemization of Attorneys’ Fees and Costs.

Attorney/Expert

Year

Hours

Rate

Total​​​
Susan Brown


2005

40.25

$450

$18,112.50
Enrique Gallardo

2005

17.75

$300

$  5,325.00



Total Claimed from Attorney/Expert Hours




$23,437.50






Postage


$         3.18






Copies



$         0.75 






Supplies


$         3.19
GRAND TOTAL







$23,444.62

LIF’s efforts in this proceeding were efficient.  Susan E. Brown, who has vast experience in low-income consumer utility issues, and Enrique Gallardo, who has a number of years of experience, performed all of LIF’s advocacy.  All of LIF’s work was within the scope of the proceeding and Commission jurisdiction.
F.
LIF Seeks Reasonable Market Rates.


LIF seeks fair market rates for the work of its attorneys.  The rate for work performed by Susan E. Brown, Attorney, in 2005 ($450), reflects a reasonable increase of $60 or 15% from a 2004 rate ($390) previously adopted by the Commission.


The rate claimed for work performed by Enrique Gallardo, Attorney, in 2005 ($300), reflects a reasonable increase of $25 or 9% from a 2004 rate ($275) previously adopted by the Commission.

Conclusion


LIF has satisfied the requirements of timely filing of a NOI, customer status, and demonstration of financial hardship.  LIF has made substantial contribution in a productive and efficient manner and has avoided duplication where possible.  LIF has provided a detailed itemization of the costs of its participation and has demonstrated the reasonableness of the requested hourly rates.  LIF has met all of the requirements of CPUC § 1801 et seq. and therefore requests compensation in the amount of $23,444.62.  A verification is attached.

Dated: January 4, 2006




Respectfully submitted,









Susan E. Brown









Enrique Gallardo









Maximiliano Garde









Latino Issues Forum









160 Pine Street, Suite 700









San Francisco, CA  94111









(415)284-7220









(415)284-7222 fax
VERIFICATION

I, Enrique Gallardo, am a representative of Latino Issues Forum and am authorized to make this verification on behalf of Latino Issues Forum.  The statements in the foregoing document and in all attached Appendices are true to the best of my knowledge, except for those matters that are stated on information and belief, and as to those matters, I believe them to be true.

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed this 4th day of January 2006, in San Francisco, California

Enrique Gallardo

Latino Issues Forum

160 Pine Street, Suite 700

San Francisco, CA  94111

(415)284-7220

(415)284-7222 fax

enriqueg@lif.org
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�    LIF also cites Commission precedent stating that “it is impossible under the statutes governing intervenor compensation to reduce intervenor compensation awards on account of duplication once the Commission has determined that the participant made a ‘substantial contribution’ in Commission proceedings.” (footnote omitted). See D.04-07-039, p. 4.


� See D.05-05-009 and D.04-10-032.  The rates LIF proposed for 2005 for Susan Brown and Enrique Gallardo are the rates LIF has proposed for its advocates in the pending Rulemaking 04-10-010.


� See D.05-05-009 and D.04-10-032.
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								Issue Codes

		Susan E. Brown				O		Outreach, Use of CBOs

		Latino Issues Forum				C		Care Changes (Eligibility, Tiers) &  Auto. Enrollment in LIEE

		160 Pine Street, Suite 700				L		LIEE energy efficiency changes

		San Francisco, CA 94111				M		Moratorium on shut-offs

						R		Care recertification suspension

						G		General, Other

				LOW-INCOME R04-01-006		F		Fees

		Date		Description		Hours		O		C		L		M		R		G		F

		2/9/05		Review OIR & prepare letter to docket office and prepare comments on calegorization		1.00												1.00

		2/10/05		Review joint comments of Telacu, Maravilla, etc.		0.25												0.25

		3/10/05		Prepare reply commments to Telacu motion		2.75		1.00				1.00						0.75

		3/15/05		Rev. rep comm SDG&E/SoCal Gas - gas testing; rev ORA comm - standardization;

				Rev SCE comm on self generation incentive issues; rev comments Sierra Pacific		1.00												1.00

		9/28/05		Call & conf. w/ Haley Goodson (.25); conf w/ Luis and Review TURN memo (.25)		0.50				0.25				0.25

				Confer with J. Hodges(.25); call to Haley Goodson (.25)		0.50								0.25		0.25

		9/29/05		Call to Theresa Cho (.25); review TURN brief (.50)		0.75				0.25				0.25		0.25

		9/30/05		Confer with Hodges re: panel & Greenlining points (.50)		0.50				0.25								0.25

		10/3/05		Called Linda Serizawa (.25)		0.25				0.25

		10/4/05		Conf w/ Hodges (.50); rev TURN & Telacu comm & errata (.75); rev agenda (.25)		1.50		0.50		0.25		0.25		0.25				0.25

				Review Edison's proposal for mitigating bills/impacts (.25)		0.25				0.25

		10/6/05		travel at 1/2 (5); hearing (4)		6.50		0.50		1.00		0.50		1.00		0.50		3.00

		10/10/05		Prepare proposal and comments on en banc hearing		7.00		2.50						2.50				2.00

		10/11/05		Review and edit comments (2.5); review Telacu proposal (.50)		3.00		1.00		0.50		1.00		0.25		0.25

				Rev PGE & SCE comm on bill impacts low income customers-Sept 30 proposals		1.00				0.50				0.25		0.25

		10/12/05		Call to Carl Wood (.25); call to Jim Hodges (.25)		0.50								0.25		0.25

				Review Proposal of ORA, standardization team, Edison

				San Diego & SoCalGas; review e-mails of TURN & GI		2.00				0.50				0.25		0.25		1.00

		10/16/05		Edit Opening Comments of LIF & revise		1.00		0.25		0.25		0.25				0.25

		10/17/05		Edit & draft & opening comments; proof; finalize		3.00		1.00		1.00		0.50				0.50

		10/19/05		Travel & return (at 1/2)(.50) & meet w/ Commiss. Gruenich & Theresa Cho (.25)		0.50		0.25										0.25

		10/20/05		Workshop on Nat' Gas and Low Income (11:30-12) (1-4:30)		4.00				1.00				1.00		1.00		1.00

				Travel at 1/2 (.50);and prepare (1)		1.25		0.25		0.25						0.25		0.50

		10/27/05		Review draft decision		1.25		0.25		0.25		0.25		0.25		0.25

						Hours		O		C		L		M		R		G		F

				TOTAL		40.25		7.50		6.75		3.75		6.75		4.25		11.25		0



&L&"Arial,Bold"&14Appendix B&C&"Arial,Bold"&14Hours for&R&"Arial,Bold"&14Susan E. Brown



Sheet2

		





Sheet3

		






_1197960235.xls
Sheet1

		

		Hours for:		Issue Codes		O		Outreach, Use of CBOs

		Enrique Gallardo				C		Care Changes (Eligibility, Tiers) &  Auto. Enrollment in LIEE

		Latino Issues Forum				L		LIEE energy efficiency changes

		160 Pine Street, Suite 700				M		Moratorium on shut-offs

		San Francisco, CA 94111				R		Care recertification suspension

						G		General, Other

				Emergency Winter Low-Income Program R.04-01-006		F		Fees

		Date		Description		Hours		O		C		L		M		R		G		F

		9/26/05		Discuss proposals w/ TURN, UCAN, Greenlining, DRA for joint filing		1.25				0.25		0.25		0.25		0.50

		10/3/05		Review proposals & compliance filings by PG&E, SCE, etc.		2.00				0.50		0.25		0.50		0.50		0.25

		10/10/05		Prepare LIF Comments of on en banc Hearing for filing		1.50		0.50		0.50				0.50

		10/13/05		Rev ACCES & DRA proposals; research previous LIF low-income proposals		2.25		0.50		0.75		1.00

		10/14/05		Review Edison Motion for changes to CARE & LIEE; Draft LIF Comments		2.75		0.50		1.25		0.50						0.50

		10/17/05		Draft LIFOpening Comments, prepare for filing		3.00		1.00		2.00

		10/19/05		Review Opening Comments of other parties		1.75				0.50		0.25		0.25		0.50		0.25

		11/3/05		Review Draft Decision		0.75				0.25				0.25		0.25

		11/18/05		Review Final Decision for Int. Comp (2 hours at 1/2 time)		1.00														1.00

		12/13/05		Prepare Req. for Int. Comp. (1 hour at 1/2 time)		0.50														0.50

		12/12/05		Finalize Req. for Int. Comp. (2 hours at 1/2 time)		1.00														1.00

						Hours		O		C		L		M		R		G		F

				Total for 2005		17.75		2.50		6.00		2.25		1.75		1.75		1.00		2.50
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Appendix D


Expenses for: Rulemaking 04-01-006

		Copies

		Postage

		Supplies



		$0.75

		$3.18

		$3.19



		

		

		



		

		

		



		

		

		TOTAL: 7.12
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Appendix A

Intervenor Compensation Claim Summary


Contribution to Decision
D.05-10-044

Proceeding


Rulemaking 04-01-006

Intervenor


Latino Issues Forum


Claim Date


January 5, 2006

Total Amount of Claim
$23,444.62







Hourly Fee

Relevant Education


First Name
Last Name
Type

Requested
Year
or Experience

Susan 

Brown

Attorney
$450

2005
Based on an 










additional year of 









experience from rate 









fixed by Commission 









in D.05-05-009 and 









D.04-10-032.


Enrique 
Gallardo
Attorney
$300

2005
Based on an 










additional year of 









experience from rate 









fixed by Commission 









in D.05-05-009 and 









D.04-10-032.


